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Batch Place 
visited 

Date of 
visit 

Total No. 
of 
students 

Faculties in-
charge 

Purpose 

Part II 
Honours and 
Part I 
Honours 
 

 
Kodaikanal, 
Tamil Nadu 
 

 
 

06.01.2018 

 
 

14 

 
Dr. Shampriya 
Chowdhury 
 
Dr. Sangita 
Daschowdhury 
 
Mr. Swapan 
Kumar Panda 
(Group IV 
Staff) 

As per practical examination 
syllabus curriculum of 
University. The long 
excursion to a specialized 
phytogeographical zone 
(Western ghats) is 
compulsory for the students 
to study floristic 
components and 
phytogeographical 
characteristics of the area. 
Field records viz. field note 
books with ecological notes 
on the plants of the area, 
voucher specimen book and 
herbarium specimens were 
prepared by the student 
which is evaluated in 
University Examination. 
 
 

Part II 
Honours and 
Part II 
General  

Subhasgram, 
South 24 
Parganas, 
west Bengal 

21.02.2018 12 Dr. Sangita 
Daschowdhury 

As per practical examination 
syllabus curriculum of 
University. Local field tour 
to a region is necessary to 
get familiar with local flora 
and to study characters 
required for their 
identification. Field note 
books and herbarium 
specimens were prepared 
by the student which were 
evaluated in University 
Examination. 



Honours excursion at Kodaikanal             Honours and General excursion at Subhasgram 

 

Name of the students Part I Honours     Name of the students Part II Honours 

1. Ishita Bhowmick     1. Poulomi De 

2. Payel Chowdhury                                            2. Rahel Maiti 

3. Disha Banerjee                                                3.  Debolina Bhadra  

4. Dola Ghosh                4. Susmita Pal 

5. Srijani Basu     5. Poulomi Majumder 

6. Shraboni Pal      

7. Subhamita Pal 

8. Dola Ghosh 

9. Noor Aisha jahan 

  Name of the students Part II General 

1. Riya Sarkar 

2. Shayani Chakrabarty 

3. Shreya Das 

4. Supriti Mukherjee 

5. Sankari Nandi 

6. Manisha Talukdar 

7. Rakhi Ghosh                                                                                                                                                                                                           


